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We have power of attorney to use the name of Jesus. 
 
Power of Attorney is the authority to act for another person. It is valuable depending on 
the person who gave it. 
 
I John 5:13-15 (NKJV) – 13 These things I have written to you who believe in the name 
of the Son of God, that you may know that you have eternal life, and that you may 
continue to believe in the name of the Son of God. 14 Now this is the confidence that we 
have in Him, that if we ask anything according to His will, He hears us. 15 And if we 
know that He hears us, whatever we ask, we know that we have the petitions that we 
have asked of Him. 
 
Matthew 28:18-20 (NIV) – 18 Then Jesus came to them and said, "All authority in 
heaven and on earth has been given to me. 19 Therefore [YOU] go and make disciples 
of all nations, baptizing them in the name of the Father and of the Son and of the Holy 
Spirit, 20 and teaching them to obey everything I have commanded you. And surely I am 
with you always, to the very end of the age." 
 
Power of attorney not used is the same as not having it. Most Christians live as if it 
doesn’t exist in their lives. 
 
The authority of Jesus rules in heaven, on earth, and under the earth. It rules over 
everyone and everything. 
 
Philippians 2:5-11 (TLB) – 5 Your attitude should be the kind that was shown us by 
Jesus Christ, 6 who, though he was God, did not demand and cling to his rights as God, 
7 but laid aside his mighty power and glory, taking the disguise of a slave and becoming 
like men.  8 And he humbled himself even further, going so far as actually to die a 
criminal's death on a cross.  9 Yet it was because of this that God raised him up to the 
heights of heaven and gave him a name which is above every other name, 10 that at the 
name of Jesus every knee shall bow in things or beings in heaven and things or beings 
on earth and things or beings under the earth, 11 and every tongue shall confess that 
Jesus Christ is Lord, to the glory of God the Father. 
 
John 16:23-24 (NKJV) – 23 "And in that day you will ask Me nothing. Most assuredly, I 
say to you, whatever you ask the Father in My name He will give you.  24 Until now you 
have asked nothing in My name. Ask, and you will receive, that your joy may be full. 
 
John 14:12-14 (NKJV) – 12 "Most assuredly, I say to you, he who believes in Me, the 
works that I do he will do also; and greater works than these he will do, because I go to 
My Father. 13 And whatever you ask (Aiteo grk – demand, call for or require) in My 



name, that I will do, that the Father may be glorified in the Son. 14 If you ask anything in 
My name, I will do it. 
 
Using the name of Jesus is not praying for God to do something. Rather, it is exercising 
His power in His name by faith. If you won’t do it, God won’t do it for you. 
 
Acts 3:6-8 (NIV) – 6 Then Peter said, "Silver or gold I do not have, but what I have I 
give you. In the name of Jesus Christ of Nazareth, walk." 7 Taking him by the right hand, 
he helped him up, and instantly the man's feet and ankles became strong. 8 He jumped 
to his feet and began to walk. Then he went with them into the temple courts, walking 
and jumping, and praising God. 
 
Acts 3:16 (NKJV) – 16 And His name, through faith in His name, has made this man 
strong, whom you see and know. Yes, the faith which comes through Him has given him 
this perfect soundness in the presence of you all. 
 
Acts 4:8-10 (NIV) – 8 Then Peter, filled with the Holy Spirit, said to them: "Rulers and 
elders of the people! 9 If we are being called to account today for an act of kindness 
shown to a cripple and are asked how he was healed, 10 then know this, you and all the 
people of Israel: It is by the name of Jesus Christ of Nazareth, whom you crucified but 
whom God raised from the dead, that this man stands before you healed. 
 
Command that the circumstance bow their knee to the name of Jesus. 
 
Luke 10:19 (NIV) – 19 I have given you authority to trample on snakes and scorpions 
and to overcome all the power of the enemy; nothing will harm you. 
 
Mark 16:15 - 18 – 15 And He said to them, "Go into all the world and preach the gospel 
to every creature.  16 He who believes and is baptized will be saved; but he who does 
not believe will be condemned.  17 And these signs will follow those who believe: In My 
name they will cast out demons; they will speak with new tongues; 18 they will take up 
serpents; and if they drink anything deadly, it will by no means hurt them; they will lay 
hands on the sick, and they will recover." 


