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Jesus came for all people. 

 
Luke 2:7-11 - And she brought forth her firstborn Son, and wrapped Him in swaddling 
cloths, and laid Him in a manger, because there was no room for them in the inn. 8 
Now there were in the same country shepherds living out in the fields, keeping watch 
over their flock by night. 9 And behold, an angel of the Lord stood before them, and the 
glory of the Lord shone around them, and they were greatly afraid. 10 Then the angel 
said to them, "Do not be afraid, for behold, I bring you good news of great joy which 
will be to all people. 11 For there is born to you this day in the city of David a Savior, 
who is Christ the Lord. 
 
No one is excluded from the circle of God’s love. 
 
However, God’s love must be received. All people are created by God, but all people are 
not God’s children. 
 
John 1:10-13 - Jesus came into the very world he created, but the world didn't 
recognize him. 11 He came to his own people, and even they rejected him. 12 But to all 
who believed him and accepted him, he gave the right to become children of God. 13 
They are reborn—not with a physical birth resulting from human passion or plan, but a 
birth that comes from God.   
 
God’s love is unconditional, but God’s grace, favor, and blessings are not. 
 
Matthew 17:14-21 - When they came to the crowd, a man approached Jesus and 
knelt before him. 15 "Lord, have mercy on my son," he said. "He has seizures and is 
suffering greatly. He often falls into the fire or into the water. 16 I brought him to your 
disciples, but they could not heal him."  17 "O unbelieving and perverse generation," 
Jesus replied, "how long shall I stay with you? How long shall I put up with you? Bring 
the boy here to me."  18 Jesus rebuked the demon, and it came out of the boy, and he 
was healed from that moment. 19 Then the disciples came to Jesus in private and 
asked, "Why couldn't we drive it out?"  20 So Jesus said to them, "Because of your 
unbelief; for assuredly, I say to you, if you have faith as a mustard seed, you will say to 
this mountain, 'Move from here to there,' and it will move; and nothing will be 
impossible for you.  21 However, this kind does not go out except by prayer and 
fasting."  
 



James 4:4-5 - You adulterous people, don't you know that friendship with the world is 
hatred or opposition toward God? Anyone who chooses to be a friend of the world 
becomes an enemy of God. 5 Or do you think Scripture says without reason that the 
Spirit he caused to live in us envies intensely?   
 
Jesus envies intensely when his bride commits adultery with the world. Fasting is like a 
marriage retreat! 
 
James 6-10 - But He gives us more grace. That is why Scripture says:  "God resists 
the proud but gives grace to the humble." 7 Submit yourselves, then, to God. Resist the 
devil, and he will flee from you. 8 Come near to God and he will come near to you. 
Wash your hands, you sinners, and purify your hearts, you double-minded. 9 Grieve, 
mourn and wail. Change your laughter to mourning and your joy to gloom. 10 Humble 
yourselves before the Lord, and he will lift you up. 
 
 


